

2022 Bid Tabulation Sheet

Denotes lowest bidder

NO BID - Denotes no bid

NR denotes not responsive

GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL - 22 - 0013

	Petroleum Traders	Lott Oil	Mansfield Oil			
Regular Total	0.1874	0.1960	0.2821			
Ultra Low Sulfur Dyed Diesel	-0.0009	0.0050	0.0791			
Clear Diesel	0.1962	0.2000	0.2791			

ASPHALT PRODUCTS - 22 - 0010

No bids received

Tack	
------	--

AGGREGATE - 22 - 0022

	Benton and Brown	Granite Mountain	Hanson Aggregates	
Washed Gravel	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
#67 Granite	NO BID	\$35.00	NO BID	
#57 Granite	\$38.50	\$34.50	NO BID	
#610 Granite	\$33.50	\$31.00	NO BID	
#67 Limestone	NO BID	NO BID	\$32.00	
#57 Limestone	NO BID	NO BID	\$32.00	
#610 Limestone	NO BID	NO BID	\$32.00	
Crushed concrete (class II specifications)	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
30lb rip rap	\$43.50	\$41.00	NO BID	
Coarse sand	\$30.00	NO BID	NO BID	

REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE - 22 - 0018

	Southwest Sales	Co-Heir Drainage	Coastal Culvert		
12", 8 FT. JOINTS	NO BID	\$22.00	NO BID		
15", 8 FT. JOINTS	NO BID	\$25.00	NO BID		
18", 8 FT. JOINTS	NO BID	\$27.00	NO BID		
24", 8 FT. JOINTS	NO BID	\$40.00	NO BID		
30", 8 FT. JOINTS	NO BID	\$55.00	NO BID		
36", 8 FT. JOINTS	NO BID	\$76.00	NO BID		
42", 8 FT. JOINTS	NO BID	\$108.00	NO BID		
48", 8 FT. JOINTS	NO BID	\$130.00	NO BID		
54", 8 FT. JOINTS	NO BID	\$160.00	NO BID		
60", 8 FT. JOINTS	NO BID	\$184.00	NO BID		
72", 8 FT. JOINTS	NO BID	\$260.00	NO BID		

PLASTIC CULVERT PIPE - 22 - 0018

Ribbed PVC Pipe

12", 22 ft lengths Per linear ft	NO BID	\$12.60	\$11.09		
15" 22 ft lengths Per linear ft	NO BID	\$20.00	\$17.59		
18" 22 ft lengths Per linear ft	NO BID	\$28.00	\$24.96		
24" 22 ft lengths Per linear ft	NO BID	\$50.00	\$44.70		
30" 22 ft lengths Per linear ft	NO BID	\$72.00	\$64.06		
36" 22 ft lengths Per linear ft	NO BID	\$95.00	\$87.79		

Double Wall Polypropylene Pipe

12", 20 ft lengths Per liner ft	NO BID	\$10.50	\$11.03		
15", 20 ft lengths Per liner ft	NO BID	\$14.25	\$15.17		
18", 20 ft lengths Per liner ft	NO BID	\$20.25	\$21.22		
24", 20 ft lengths Per liner ft	NO BID	\$30.75	\$31.33		
30", 20 ft lengths Per liner ft	NO BID	\$43.00	\$45.14		
36", 20 ft lengths Per liner ft	NO BID	\$59.00	\$63.11		
42", 20 ft lengths Per liner ft	NO BID	\$70.00	\$74.13		
48", 20 ft lengths Per liner ft	NO BID	\$94.50	\$99.68		
60", 20 ft lengths Per liner ft	NO BID	\$128.25	\$141.05		

CORRUGATED METAL CULVERTS - 22 - 0018

16 gauge 12" Asphalt coated, 10 to 24' Per linear ft	\$37.12	\$23.50	\$21.03		
16 gauge 15" Asphalt coated, 10 to 24' Per linear ft	\$46.12	\$29.25	\$26.17		
16 gauge 18" Asphalt coated, 10 to 24' Per linear ft	\$54.75	\$37.00	\$33.09		
16 gauge 24" Asphalt coated, 10 to 24' Per linear ft	\$72.75	\$46.75	\$41.84		
16 gauge 30" Asphalt coated, 10 to 24' Per linear ft	\$90.00	\$59.25	\$53.22		
16 gauge 36" Asphalt coated, 16 to 20' Per linear ft	\$108.00	\$70.00	\$62.94		
16 gauge 42" Asphalt coated, 16 to 20' Per linear ft	\$126.75	\$88.50	\$79.45		
16 gauge 48" Asphalt coated, 20' Per linear ft	\$145.12	\$101.00	\$90.47		
14 gauge 54" Asphalt coated, 20' Per linear ft	\$206.25	\$141.75	\$142.00		
14 gauge 60" Asphalt coated, 20', 3"x1" or 5" x1" corrugations	\$229.12	\$180.00	\$160.84		
14 gauge 72" Asphalt coated, 20", 3"x1" or 5" x1" corrugations	\$273.00	\$232.50	\$208.94		
14 gauge 78" Asphalt coated, 20", 3"x1" or 5" x1" corrugations	\$295.50	\$250.25	\$224.88		
14 gauge 84" Asphalt coated, 20", 3"x1" or 5" x1" corrugations	\$318.00	\$280.00	\$251.52		
14 gauge 90" Asphalt coated, 20", 3"x1" or 5" x1" corrugations	\$362.63	\$296.75	\$266.13		
14 gauge 96" Asphalt coated, 20", 3"x1" or 5" x1" corrugations	\$403.39	\$317.50	\$285.00		

TREATED YELLOW PINE PILING - 22 - 0016

No bids received

13" Butt, or 12" /3' in 25 to 50 ft. Lengths treated creosote oil	
14" Butt or 13"/3' in natural taper 51 to 60 ft. lengths, traeted creosote oil	
13" Butt or 12"/3' natural taper in 25 to 50 ft. lengths, treated CCA	
14" Butt, or 13"/3" natural taper in 51 to 60 ft. lengths, treateed CCA	

TREATED YELLOW PINE LUMBER - 22 - 0014

No bids received

3 x 8 x 12, and 14 ft. treated Crosote oil	
6 x 12 x 16 ft rough treated Creosote oil	
12 X 12 X 26 ft. rough treated Creosote oil	
6 x 6 x 16 ft. rough treated Creosote oil	
3 x 10 x 28 ft. rough treated Creostoe oil	
3 x 8 x 12, and 14 ft. treated CCA	
6 x 12 x 16 ft. rough treated CCA	
12 x 12 x 26 ft. rough treated CCA	
6 x 6 x 16 ft. rough treated CCA	
3 x 10 x 28 ft. rough treated CCA	

ASPHALTIC COLD MIX - 22 - 0012

Type D – High Performance (per ton)

Diamond B

Delivered to Benton	\$113.00
Picked up at plant	\$89.00

PETROLEUM PRODUCTS - 22 - 0015

Lottoil

Diesel Motor Oil-SAE grades 10w-50w Per Gallon	\$7.79	
Gear Oil –SAE 90 & 140 (Special MP Type) Per Pound	\$1.38	
Automatic Transmission Fluid Per Gallon	\$7.01	
Universal Tractor Hydraulic Fluid Per Gallon	\$6.59	

STRIPING PAINT - 22 - 0017Ozark
Materials

5 Gallons Yellow	\$69.95
5 Gallons White	\$67.45
Glass beads / per pound	\$0.52

HOT MIX - 22 - 0011Benton and
Brown

HOT MIX (per ton)	\$80.00
-------------------	---------

TIRES - 22 - 0021Moore's
goodyear
Southern
Tire

13.00 X 24 GRADER TIRE – 10 PLY, G 2 – MG OR EQUAL	\$483.71	\$305.17		
460/85R38 TRACTOR TIRE, R 1 TREAD	\$969.77	\$900.00		
14.9 X 28 TRACTOR TIRE, R 1 TREAD	\$619.68	\$395.00		
14.9 X 24 TRACTOR TIRE, R 1 TREAD	\$376.49	\$328.00		
10.00 X 16 TRACTOR TRI RILE	\$178.56	\$154.00		
11.2 X 24 TRACTOR TIRE, R 1 TREAD	\$270.55	\$217.00		
16.9 X 34 TRACTOR TIRE, R 1 TREAD	\$694.46	\$582.22		
16.9 X 30 TRACTOR TIRE, R 1 TREAD	\$488.69	\$480.00		
9.5 L X 15 TRACTOR TIRE	\$77.39	\$167.99		