

**2020 Bid Tabulation Sheet**

Denotes lowest bidder

\* Denotes no bid

NR denotes not responsive

**GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL - 20 - 0013**

	Petroleum Traders	Mansfield Oil	Lott Oil	Central Oil and Supply	Indigo Energy	
Regular Total	0.2178	0.2461	0.2050	0.2332	0.2294	
Ultra Low Sulfur Dyed Diesel	0.0156	0.0364	0.0200	0.0313	0.0313	
Clear Diesel	0.1956	0.2284	0.2050	0.2334	0.2285	

**ASPHALT PRODUCTS - 20 - 0010**

	Asphalt Products
P-I Prime / AEP ALT	\$4.00
Tack	*
Penetration Asphalt	*
Penetration Asphalt	*
Cationic Asphalt	*
Cationic Asphalt	*

**STRIPING PAINT - 20 - 0017**

	Sherwin Williams	Ozark Materials	Ennis Flint	
Yellow	\$49.70	\$50.70	\$55.00	
White	\$48.95	\$42.75	\$52.20	
Glass Beads	\$0.59	\$0.39	\$0.60	

**WASHED GRAVEL AND COVER GRAVEL - 20 - 0019**

	Benton and Brown	Granite Mountain		
Washed Maintenance Gravel (per ton)	No Bid	No Bid		
Crushed Stone Base Course Aggregate	\$26.25	\$28.50		
Crushed Stone Surface Course Aggregate	\$29.95	\$28.50		

**REINFORCED CONCRETE PIPE - 20 - 0018**

	Coastal Culvert	Co-Heir Drainage	Coburns	Contech	Southwest Sales
12", 8 FT. JOINTS	No Bid	\$16.10	\$15.65	No Bid	No Bid
15", 8 FT. JOINTS	No Bid	\$17.90	\$17.39	No Bid	No Bid
18", 8 FT. JOINTS	No Bid	\$18.80	\$18.26	No Bid	No Bid
24", 8 FT. JOINTS	No Bid	\$29.50	\$28.70	No Bid	No Bid
30", 8 FT. JOINTS	No Bid	\$42.05	\$40.87	No Bid	No Bid
36", 8 FT. JOINTS	No Bid	\$57.25	\$55.65	No Bid	No Bid
42", 8 FT. JOINTS	No Bid	\$77.85	\$75.65	No Bid	No Bid
48", 8 FT. JOINTS	No Bid	\$96.65	\$93.91	No Bid	No Bid
54", 8 FT. JOINTS	No Bid	\$118.10	\$114.78	No Bid	No Bid
60", 8 FT. JOINTS	No Bid	\$139.55	\$135.65	No Bid	No Bid
72", 8 FT. JOINTS	No Bid	\$191.45	\$186.09	No Bid	No Bid

**PLASTIC CULVERT PIPE - 20 - 0018**

	Coastal Culvert	C-Heir Drainage	Coburns	Contech	Southwest Sales
12", 20 ft lengths per linear foot	\$7.84	\$5.90	\$6.26	\$6.92	\$4.90
15", 20 ft lengths per linear foot	\$11.21	\$8.25	\$8.95	\$9.89	\$6.65
18", 20 ft, lengths per linear foot	\$16.44	\$11.05	\$13.12	\$14.51	\$8.75
24", 20 ft, lengths per linear foot	\$29.79	\$18.20	\$23.77	\$26.28	\$14.70
30", 20 ft, lengths per linear foot	\$42.16	\$28.00	\$33.64	\$37.20	\$21.00
36", 20 ft, lengths per linear foot	\$55.71	\$34.30	\$44.45	\$49.15	\$28.00
42", 20 ft lengths per linear foot	*	\$44.65	*	*	\$40.25
48", 20 ft lengths per linear foot	*	\$55.60	*	*	\$47.60
54", 20 ft lengths per linear foot	*	*	*	*	*
60", 20 ft lengths per linear foot	*	\$94.85	*	*	\$80.50
72", 20 ft lengths per linear foot	*	*	*	*	*

**CORRUGATED METAL CULVERTS - 20 - 0018**

	Coastal Culvert	Co-heir Drainage	Coburns	Contech	Southwest Sales
12", 10 to 24' Per linear ft	\$13.00	\$13.15	\$13.59	\$13.16	NR
15", 10 to 24' Per linear ft	\$16.50	\$16.60	\$17.15	\$16.61	NR
18", 10 to 24' Per linear ft	\$21.00	\$21.10	\$21.79	\$21.11	NR
24", 10 to 24' Per linear ft	\$26.50	\$26.65	\$27.51	\$26.64	NR
30", 10 to 24' Per linear ft	\$33.50	\$33.90	\$35.01	\$33.91	NR
36", 16 to 20' Per linear ft	\$39.50	\$39.80	\$41.10	\$39.80	NR
42", 16 to 20' Per linear ft	\$51.00	\$51.70	\$53.38	\$51.69	NR
48", 20' Per linear ft	\$61.00	\$61.20	\$63.20	\$61.20	NR
54", 20' Per linear ft	\$82.00	\$81.60	\$84.26	\$81.60	NR
60", 20' Per linear ft	\$100.00	\$88.95	\$91.88	\$88.98	NR
72", 20' Per linear ft	\$132.00	\$116.10	\$119.87	\$116.08	NR

**TREATED YELLOW PINE PILING - 20 - 0016**

13" Butt, or 12" /3' in 12 to 24 ft. lengths	Re Bid
13" Butt or 12"/3' in 25 to 50 ft. lengths	Re Bid
14" Butt or 13"/3' natural taper in 51 to 60 ft. lengths, treated w/ 12 lbs. #1	Re Bid

**TREATED YELLOW PINE LUMBER - 20 - 0014**

3 x 8 x 12, 14 & 16'	Re Bid
6 x 12 x 16'	Re Bid
10 x 12 x 16 X 24 and 26	Re Bid
6 x 6 x 16'	Re Bid
3 x 10 x 28'	Re Bid

**ASPHALTIC COLD MIX - 20 - 0012**

	Diamond B
Type A – Stone (per ton)	
Delivered to Benton	*
Picked up at plant	*
Type B – Expanded Clay (per ton)	
Delivered to Benton	*
Picked up at plant	*
Type C – Crushed Gravel (per ton)	
Delivered to Benton	*
Picked up at plant	*
Type D – High Performance (per ton)	
Delivered to Benton	\$108.00
Picked up at plant	\$86.00
Type E – Multi-grade (per ton)	
Delivered to Benton	*
Picked up at plant	*

**PETROLEUM PRODUCTS - 20 - 0015**

	Central Oil	Lott Oil
Diesel Motor Oil-SAE grades 10w-50w Per Gallon	\$6.48	\$6.90
Gear Oil -SAE 90 & 140 (Special MP Type) Per Pound	\$1.29	\$1.97
Automatic Transmission Fluid Per Gallon	\$5.19	\$8.90
Universal Tractor Hydraulic Fluid Per Gallon	\$5.39	\$5.75

**HOT MIX - 20 - 0011**

	Benton and Brown
HOT MIX (per ton)	\$73.50

**TIRES - 20 - 0021**

	Gateway Tire	Southern Tire Mart		
13.00 X 24 GRADER TIRE - 16 PLY, G 2 - MG OR EQUAL	\$293.65	\$275.00		
14.00 X 24 GRADER TIRE - 10 PLY, R 4 - MG OR EQUAL	\$352.37	\$323.00		
14.9 X 28 TRACTOR TIRE, R 1 TREAD	\$339.02	\$275.00		
14.9 X 24 TRACTOR TIRE, R 1 TREAD	\$302.76	\$250.00		
10.00 X 16 TRACTOR TRI RILE	\$144.09	\$170.00		
11.2 X 24 TRACTOR TIRE, R 1 TREAD	\$178.81	\$155.00		
16.9 X 34 TRACTOR TIRE, R 1 TREAD	\$606.76	\$400.00		
16.9 X 30 TRACTOR TIRE, R 1 TREAD	\$491.09	\$340.00		
9.5 L X 15 TRACTOR TIRE	\$103.23	\$83.00		